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What is the important fact about Indonesian development in the last 30 years?
The fact is that it has not followed a path that leads to sustainable development.
Indonesia’s development has been heavily dependent on natural resource
extractions. Renewable resources such as water, forests, fisheries and other bio-
logical resources have been exploited beyond their ability to regenerate and will
continue to diminish in the years ahead. Reliance on non-renewable resources
and such activities as mining, minerals and fossil fuels cannot be sustained for
ever. Clearly, the whole process of national development has not been sustain-
able. The question is: why and how has this situation occurred? 

Let me go back to the situation 30 years ago. When we Indonesians started
to formulate our development policies in 1966–67, there was little mention of
environmental issues anywhere in the world; in particular, there was little men-
tion of the links between development and the environment. Accordingly, when
we began to draw up a national development plan in 1968, our focus was solely
on economic development.

Up till the early 1970s, international development conferences tended to
focus on single-track economic development involving infrastructure, agricul-
ture and other primary sectors – so-called ‘normal’ economic development. In
1972, the United Nations held a Conference on the Human Environment in
Stockholm. At the Stockholm conference, something new emerged: the envi-
ronment. Most developing country delegations to the conference were econo-
mists who knew a lot about economics but nothing about the environment.
What was this environmental issue about? Those of us from the developing
countries knew the tune but we did not know the words of the song!

It is also important to note that, at around the time of the Stockholm confer-
ence, developing countries were campaigning for countries of the North to pro-
vide as much as 0.7 per cent of their GDP in aid to the South. Hence developing
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countries, including Indonesia, thought that the Stockholm conference was only
a scheme by the North to impose a new condition, related to aid, on the South.
So we did nothing.

Subsequently, Indonesia entered a new stage of development after experienc-
ing an oil bonanza. Instinctively we felt that the proceeds should be used for
poverty alleviation. Revenue from the oil bonanza funded the Inpres program of
presidential grants for village development, rural development, village schools
and so on. But we were still not sure what we should do with this animal called
the environment. In 1978 the Indonesian government established a Ministry of
the Environment, and I was appointed minister. The first agency that I visited in
this capacity was the World Bank, which had a vice-president for Asia. I asked
him, ‘What is this environmental issue? How do we translate that into develop-
ment policy?’ The reply was, ‘We are the World Bank; we are a financial insti-
tution; we don’t have enough staff members to deal with issues like the
environment’. Clearly, at that time mainstream development did not take account
of the environment.

However, I was referred to Mr James Lee, one of the few experts in the
World Bank dealing with the environment at that time. He taught me what the
environment was all about and how there is an environmental argument in
debates about development. I began to understand how the environment fits
into the picture, but I was still not absolutely clear about the linkage between
development and the environment. Mr Lee suggested that I talk to NGOs such
as Friends of the Earth and the Environmental Defense Fund. I asked them a
simple question: ‘What the hell is “environment”? How do we reconcile the
environment and development?’ After several discussions with Friends of the
Earth and the Environmental Defense Fund, I noticed that civil society’s think-
ing on the issue of the need to integrate environment and development was
already much more advanced than that of formal institutions, including interna-
tional institutions like the World Bank.

Let me now move on to the 1980s and 1990s. What was the ‘religion’ at that
time? It was the ‘Washington Consensus’: governments of developing countries
were too deeply involved in development and should pull out; the private sec-
tor should do the job. The philosophy was that governments must undertake pri-
vatisation and that countries must rely upon the market.

For Indonesia, the message was clear: we must adopt a market paradigm, and
the private sector should dominate the market. Indonesia embraced the Washing-
ton Consensus and its corollary that we should deregulate state enterprises. We
did everything possible in that direction. Mind you, we were very high-spirited
and enthusiastic in doing so. We even deregulated the financial market! Mean-
while, environmental issues were becoming more and more significant.

Do readers remember Our Common Future (WCED 1987) and the 1992 Rio
conference?1 Suddenly there were two conflicting trends. On one side, there
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was economic development a là the Washington Consensus: let the market pre-
vail and encourage privatisation. On the other side, there was the message from
the Rio conference: the need for sustainable development and a focus on envi-
ronmental development. Wait a minute! There is a conflict here. The Rio con-
ference told us that there is a problem with the market, namely market failure.
The depletion of natural resources was not accounted for. Environmental exter-
nalities as a consequence of development processes were not internalised.
There was something wrong with the rigid economic approach.

Can people imagine what was in the minds of developing countries? On the
one hand, we had listened to the World Bank talking about the role of the mar-
ket economy. On the other hand, suddenly there was another perspective: sus-
tainable development that took the environment and market failure into
account. Developing countries were in complete confusion, though we under-
stood the need to maintain the environment.

For me in Indonesia, the main problem in translating this need into devel-
opment policy was as follows. Around the world at that time, the only indica-
tors of development were economic ones; there were no indicators to measure
the condition or quality of the environment and whether the environment was
getting better or worse. Environmental indicators were considered irrelevant.

Let me give an example of this type of approach. When we went to the aid
consortium Inter-Governmental Group on Indonesia2 we were asked, ‘What is
your rate of growth? What is your budget deficit? What is your tax collection
rate? What is your investment rate?’ We were not asked any questions about the
environment. As the country’s Minister of the Environment, I felt a bit out of
place. Further problems arose during cabinet sessions. When the Environment
Minister raised his hand, the Industry Minister would always say, ‘Up goes the
price’. The main perception in cabinet at the time was that taking the environ-
ment into account would always lead to higher prices. Hence there was little
action on environmental sustainability.

I became a kind of public relations spokesman. I was invited to various con-
ferences throughout the world to speak about development and the environment
in Indonesia, and always emphasised that the environment was important in our
country. All these speeches were given in a spirit of goodness and glory – with
the idea that improving the environment was important and beneficial for
Indonesia and that Indonesian laws on the environment were very good too.
Nobody attacked my remarks, since I always said, ‘According to Indonesia’s
laws on the environment, this is what Indonesia wants to do’ or ‘According to
the presidential decree, this is what we are willing to do’. Nobody asked ‘Is
Indonesia actually doing it?’ Hence, I was conveniently free from critique.

The turning point occurred when the financial crisis hit in 1997–98 and it
became clear that our development policies must have been flawed. Other
developing countries also shared this perception. Do readers remember the
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Summit of the Americas in Santiago, Chile, in April 1998? All of a sudden the
Washington Consensus was reviewed and attacked by the developing countries.
The outcome was the ‘Santiago Consensus’ that market failures need to be
recognised, that the government needs to correct the market, that the financial
market needs to be reviewed and studied, and that environmental factors should
be taken into account – including the depletion of resources and the need to
internalise externalities. Hence, the environment became an important factor in
economics.

For Indonesia, it was too late. We had already suffered. We had a disastrous
financial crisis, soaring unemployment, a steep drop in the human development
index, a high index of perceived corruption, accelerated deterioration of the
environment, shrinking natural resources, increased illegal resource extraction
and a serious weakening of governance. From 1998 to 2004, Indonesia’s devel-
opment was accompanied by great soul searching as we asked what had gone
wrong and what we must do in the future.

We now understand the need to reform the total development strategy of
Indonesia and to achieve triple-track development – not only economic devel-
opment but also social and environmental development. But how do we do this?
What model can we use? Indonesia has now installed a new government under
the leadership of Susilo Bambang Yudhoyono. Our strategy for future develop-
ment should focus on four issues.

First, we need good governance, because market failure requires govern-
ment intervention and government intervention requires good governance.
Good governance itself requires three important changes: public sector reform,
better service delivery, and better laws and better enforcement of laws.

Second, we need to repair and improve infrastructure. This should include
not only economic infrastructure such as roads but also social infrastructure such
as schools. And let us concentrate on infrastructure for the poor, not infrastruc-
ture such as shopping malls, though these are now very popular in Indonesia.

Third, we need a pro-poor policy. Why not recognise the informal sector?
Why not get the informal sector into the mainstream of development? Why not
improve services to the poor? Why not create productive employment? 

Fourth, development should not be only government-led: there is a need for
other stake-holders to be partners in development. Development should involve
government, civil society and business in a balanced triangular partnership in
which all play an equal role. Civil society must become a countervailing power
to business and government.

This ideal situation seems impossible to achieve. However, the recent elec-
tion has shown that the people are against the ruling elite – that is, the estab-
lished political elite. They are also against established big businesses that, in
cooperation with the political elite, through money politics, want to dictate who
should be elected and who should not. In brief, in this election we have seen a
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revolt of the person on the street, of civil society. That is why it is important that
the new government should work with civil society and improve and stimulate
its development. 

In summary, I foresee that the concept of sustainable development will now
comprise economic, social and environmental considerations supported by gov-
ernment, business and civil society. This book is a major step in understanding
the challenges of sustainable development embracing two frameworks: the eco-
nomic–social–environment framework and the government–business–civil
society framework. The focus this time is forestry, fisheries and mining.
Equipped with a better understanding of likely challenges and opportunities, I
believe that, by adopting these two frameworks, we will succeed in the imple-
mentation of our development processes.

NOTES

1 United Nations Conference on Environment and Development, Rio de Janeiro, 3–14
June 1992.

2 This was an international group of lenders established in 1967 by the Netherlands to
coordinate multilateral aid to Indonesia. In 1992, it was replaced by the Consultative
Group on Indonesia.
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